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Here ' s H o w to Se l l the Mu l t ib i l l i on Do l la r 

V e g e t a t i o n M a i n t e n a n c e and C o n t r o l M a r k e t 

If you manufacture or distribute equipment, herbicides, 
fungicides, insecticides, or any other product used in the 
multibillion dollar vegetation maintenance and control 
field, there is no more direct way to reach your customers 
and prospects than through the advertising pages of 
WEEDS TREES AND TURF. There's no waste circulation. 
WTT goes directly to the major buyers of these products 
in all the 50 states. It's read by contract applicators; tree 
service experts; landscape nurserymen; aerial applicators; 
golf course superintendents; supervisors for rights-of-way 
with highway departments, railways, utilities; those re-

sponsible for state and county weed and brush control, 
turf management and tree service; superintendents of 
large grounds (estates, industrial parks, military estab-
lishments, cemeteries, etc.); and the nation's prosperous 
sod growers. These buyers and users subscribe to this, 
their how-to-do-it, where-to-buy-it magazine, now in its 
6th year, because WTT talks their language. Your adver-
tising dollars sell harder and go farther in WEEDS TREES 
AND TURF. If you'd like full details, write us today and 
we'll send you one of our information-packed Market 
Fact Files by return mail. 

WEEDS 
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TURF 
1900 Euclid Avenue 

Cleveland, Ohio 44115 

Puzz led ? 


