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Selected books and videos for the industry 

GREENS MOWING MADE EASY...The 
first program in a continuing golf course 
superintendent's video training series is 
called "Greens Mowing Tips and 
Orientation." The 30-minute video, which 
features superintendents Paul Latshaw and 
Darren Davis, has 15-minute segments on 
triplex mowing and walking greens mow-
ers. Employee handbooks are included. 
Call (800) 938-4330 for a free preview tape. 

TREE CARE VIDEO. . .The National 
Arborist Association is offering a "Ropes, 
Knots and Tree Climbing" video training 
tape. It covers the newest techniques for 
using carabiners, the prusik loop and false 
crotches, as well as basic instruction in 
knots and climbing techniques. The video 
is packaged with employee comprehension 
sheets and attendance sheets for proper 
OSHA documentation. For more informa-
tion, write or call the N.A.A., P.O. Box 
1094, Amherst, NJ 03031; (800) 733-2622. 

NEW DOT GUIDE . . .To assist lawn 
care ope ra to r s in comply ing with 
Department of Transportat ion regula-
t ions , the Profess ional Lawn Care 
Association of America has developed a 
"Guide to the T r a n s p o r t a t i o n of 
Pesticides." Price is $25 for PLCAA mem-
bers, $40 for non-members . To order, 
send check (payable to PLCAA), Visa or 
MasterCard number and expiration date 
to: PLCAA, 1000 Johnson Ferry Rd. NE, 
Suite C-135, Marietta, GA 30068; or fax 
your order to (404) 578-6071. 

SHADE TREES...Written by a team of 
researchers in the Auburn University 
Department of Horticulture, "Shade Trees 
for the Southeastern U.S." is designed for 
landscapers, students, nursery operators, 
urban foresters, and anyone who works 
with trees. The 133-page softcover book 
contains more than 200 color photos. It is 
available for $10 per copy. For more infor-

mation, call Robyn Hearn at (205) 844-
4877 or send check, money order or pur-
chase order to Research Information, 110 
Comer Hall, Auburn University, Auburn, 
AL 36849. 

PESTIC IDES BY DISKETTE. . .C&P 
Press's new computer program is titled 
"Electronic Pesticide Reference." It con-
tains 30 chemical manufacturers, full text 
labels for more than 800 products, 1,000 
full text MSDSs, product summaries and 
cur ren t DOT shipping information by 
product- The program is available on CD-
ROM or Multiple Diskettes. Subscribers 
receive updates every 90 days. For more 
information, contact C&P Press at 888 
Seventh Ave., Suite 2800, New York, NY 
10106; (800) 544-7377. 

GOLF SURFACES. . . "The Complete 
Golf Surfacing Buyers Guide" contains a 
complete line of spike-resistant products 
like carpeting, rubber rolls and tiles, syn-
thetic turf and ceramic tiles for indoor 
and outdoor applications. Authors are 
Scott Shaw and Daniel Jameson. To order 
a copy, phone R.S. Global Inc. at (800) 
451-6762. 

1994 
PENNSYLVANIA'S PLANT SHOWS 

Sponsored by Pennsylvania Nurserymen's Association 

PANTS 
Julv 26-28.1994 
Valley Forge Convention Center 
King of Prussia. PA 

PLANTS 
August 17-18. 1994 
Pittsburgh Expo Mart 
Monroeville, PA 

FOR M O R E INFORMATION 

Call (717) 238-1673 

Early Registration Discount 
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