
Small Homeowner Contracts May Grow to Be Big Business 

For Arborists, Felix Tells 15th Annual N.Y. Tree Group 
By PROF. A. M. S. PRIDHAM, New York State College of Agriculture, Ithaca 

Changing of the Guard. George H. Callaway, Llenroc Tree Experts, Argyle, (left) presented 
a maple gavel to president-elect Arthur C. Sandstrom, Lewis Tree Expert Co., Jordan, while 
secretary-treasurer Dr. John A. Weidhaas of N.Y. State College of Agriculture looked on. 

"Homeowners may become 
acquainted with arborist serv-
ices from observation and their 
needs can be a source of present 
and often future business as 
young families move up the eco-
nomic ladder," according to Rob-
ert Felix, Harder Tree Service, 
Hempstead, L.I., N.Y. 

Felix addressed his remarks to 
the 15th annual meeting of New 
York State Arborists at Statler 
Hall, Cornell University, Ithaca, 
Jan. 17-19. 

Arborists gathered for the 
annual New York meeting heard 
a varied program which em-
braced fertilization, brush con-
trol, marketing, and equipment 
demonstrations. 

Professional tree work, Felix 
pointed out, began on the estates 
of Long Island; while few of 
these large holdings remain, the 
small 2- or 3-acre homesite offers 
arborists on t h e I s l and , and 
throughout the nation, a grow-
ing and lucrative market for 
professional tree care. 

Use of MH-30T, the growth 
regulator from U. S. Rubber, was 
discussed by Paul R. Bohne, 
research physiologist for the 
manufacturer, who said proper 
spring application of the com-
pound will retard, prevent, or 
suppress shoot growth on many 
woody ornamentals. 

Since ornamental p l a n t i n g s 
may not be able to utilize ferti-
lizers app l i ed in t h e spring 
when they need nutrients most 
for rapid growth, observations 
on fall feeding of woody orna-
mentals was a welcome addition 
to the 15th annual NYA program. 

Professor H. B. Tukey, of the 
New York State College of Agri-
tulture, said plant roots grow 
during the dormant season and, 
unless frozen, absorb nutrients. 
Further investigation has shown 
these nutrients are moved to the 
tops of dormant plants, Tukey 
said. However, the researchers 
found soil temperatures may be 

so low in spring the roots cannot 
absorb the spring-applied ferti-
lizer before spring growth be-
gins. Fertilizers applied in the 
fall after the plants were fully 
dormant were utilized by the 
plant for spring growth, Pro-
fessor Tukey indicated. 

Fall application of nutrients 
offers several advantages over 
spring application, Tukey con-
cluded. However, since there is 
some belief late summer appli-
cations increase t e n d e r shoot 
growth t h a t m a y be winter 
killed, he warns that fertilizer 
should not be applied until plants 
are fully dormant in the fall. 

How should arborists dispose 
of waste wood which results 
from Dutch elm sanitation or 
regular trimming? According to 
Fred Donovan of Donovan Tree 
Service in Mechanicsville, burn-
ing of wood presents local prob-
lems of smoke and fire, but per-
mits to establish brush and wood 
disposal can be obtained. Public 
objection to garbage dumps is 
understandable because of dis-
ease, smoke, and rat problems, 
Donovan maintains. 

Alternate possibilities include 
formation of a forest products 

company that might run any of 
s e v e r a l o p e r a t i o n s including 
woodchips or woodchip-chicken 
manure compost, or such art-
fancier items as driftwood or 
gnarled branches for patio or 
garden. 

The use of woodchips in road-
side construction specifications 
can be a good conservation meas-
ure providing the forest products 
company with a good market, 
Donovan concluded. 

Dr. A. A. Johnson, Director of 
Extension, spoke at the final 
luncheon and emphasized the 
fact the suburban sprawl will re-
quire roads and sewage on what 
is now poor land for agriculture, 
Johnson said. Information on 
soils, drainage, and water is lim-
ited to present agricultural data. 

Arborists engaged in tree re-
moval and t r e e p l a n t i n g are 
aware of the value of such in-
formation f r o m b i d d i n g and 
planting landscape jobs in new 
communities or the expansion of 
small communities. For t h i s 
reason, Johnson expects arborist 
services will become increasing-
ly important in the future econ-
omy of New York State and the 
nation. 


