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Here is a simple check list to follow
prior to placing your equipment into
service after winter storage.
(1)Check pressure in all tires and
inflate to the manufacturer's
specifications. Uneven pressures can
affect quality of cut.
(2)Check battery, battery posts, and
connections. Clean posts and
connections and protect them with a
thin coating of bearing grease. Check
the battery for electrolyte level and fill
to the recommended level with distilled
water if needed.
Charge the battery if necessary.
(Note, always wear safety glasses
when working around any lead/acid
battery). If it is necessary to remove or
replace a battery, always remove the
ground (usually black) cable first and
connect it last.
(3)Drain any old fuel remaining in the
fuel tank and refill with new fuel. This
may not be necessary if fuel stabilizer
was added to the fuel system when
the equipment was put into storage
last fall.
(4)Drain old engine oil and remove
and replace old oil filters. Refill with
fresh oil of the type and weight
recommended by the engine
manufacturer. Again, this might not be
necessary if oil and filter changes
were performed during off-season
servicing.
(5)Start the engine and check its
performance. If it will not start or runs
rough it's possible that fuel tar
deposits have accumulated in the fuel
system. Check and clean the
carburetor, fuel pump, fuel lines and
shut-off valve.
Check to be sure the engine has
"spark". If not, and the engine has a
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magneto-type ignition system, a thin
film of rust may have formed on the
flywheel magnets and/or the coil. It
may be necessary to remove the fan
housing and flywheel so flywheel
magnets and coil can be cleaned. If
the engine ignition system has a coil,
condenser, and distributor, these
should be checked and replaced if
faulty.
(6)Radiator liquid level needs to be
checked. If coolant was drained for the
winter or if coolant level is low, add as
needed. Use the appropriate type of
coolant and water-to coolant mixture
recommended by the engine
manufacturer. Avoid using more than
a 50% concentration of coolant.
V)ln the h~draulic system, it's a good
Idea to drain and refill with fresh
hydraulic fluid once a year. (This may
not be necessary if the unit is still new
and has relatively few hours of running
time). Check your owners manual for
~he recommended hydraulic oil change
Intervals.
A.lw,ayschange the, hydraulic system's
011 filter before placing the equipment
back in service, regardless of the
number of hours the equipment has
been in use. The filter is excellent and
inexpensive insurance.
(8)Check belt drives. Belts can 'taks a
set" if they are held in tension in one
position for long periods. With the
engine off, move each belt slowly by
hand and look for distortions, or
"bows", in the belt - these can cause it
to slip or come off. Running a belt for a
few minutes may straighten it out. If
the bows don't go away, the belt must
be replaced.
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