
GREENS REELS 
9 bladed, quiet belt drive (self-

adjusting) easy to set height of cut and 
reel to bedknife. Optional presets and 
outrigger rollers available. 

ACCESSORIES for 
Hahn Tournament Triplex 
Greensmower 
KROMER CO 

CALL FOR DEMONSTRATION 

TELEPHONE 612-472-4167 

VERTI-CUT REELS 
Verti-Cut reels use patented, 

thin offset blades to remove thatch and 
grain as they begin to form. With 67" 
of cut (the Verti-Cut reels are the same 
width, and use the same grass 
catchers, as the greens and utility 
reels) 
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VIBRA-SPIKER REELS 

Vibra-Spiker reels use gentle 
high-frequency vibration to achieve 
deep penetration, without excessive 
weight, even when ground is hard and 
dry. Full 67" swath and Triplex speed 
make spiking a task that now takes 
even less time than greensmowing. 

QUICK COUPLING 
Compare the Tournament's 

speed of operation and changeover 
with any other greensmower you 
can buy. 

TEE REELS 
6 bladed, quiet belt drive (self-

adjusting) variable speed permits 
cutting of all grasses at selected tee 
heights-of-cut. Heavy duty bedknife. 
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Suite 301 
6550 York Avenue South 
Edina, Minnesota 55435 

HOLE 
NOTES 


