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developed. I personally shed no tears 
with the ending of the stable operation, 
and was certain that my life's contact with 
horses was over with. Little did I know 
that this would not be the end of my 
involvement with horses? 

As I've mentioned in previous articles, 
The Hong Kong Golf Club will serve as 
the site for some of the equestrian events 
for the 2008 Olympics in Beijing, China. 
The Equestrian route covers approximate-
ly 7 kilometers and 27 different jump areas 
as it winds it way throughout the three 
golf courses. The spring and summer of 
2006 saw the construction of the equestri-
an route and the 27 jump areas. Each 
jump area is approximately 20,000 sq. ft. 
in size, and built to specifications that 
remind me of the construction of a USGA 
green. Excavation, drainage, sand, and a 
pre-determined turf sod were part of the 
construction process. As with most con-
struction, surprises were pretty much a 
daily occurrence. Having a Chinese con-
struction contractor that had no idea what 
a golf course was about was a recipe for 
disaster. Damaging the irrigation system 
seemed to be a daily occurrence. Dust, 
noise, traffic and course damage were con-
stant companions to be tolerated and 
endured by the golfing membership. For 
most of the golfing membership, the con-
struction event was not a pleasant experi-
ence. I quickly developed the attitude 
that patience and calmness was a virtue, 
and all would eventually be repaired and 
heal over. By the beginning of golf season 
in late September, the courses were pretty 
much back to normal. That was the case 
until the sand slitting works process 
began in early February. Sand slitting is a 
process whereby a narrow trench 4 inches 
in width and 16 inches deep was excavat-
ed out and back filled with coarse sand. 
These slits were spaced one meter apart 
across the thirty-meter wide track. These 
slits were directed into the main center 
drain line, which was initially installed in 
the first construction stage and runs 

(Continued on Page 19) 

Spending my early years on a farm in 
central Wisconsin, I came into contact with 
horses on a regular basis. In my dad's 
early days of farming, horses were used to 
work the fields on a regular basis. As a 
child, I can still recall the pride my dad 
had when he was able to buy his first new 
tractor. What a tremendous improvement 
in increasing efficiency and productivity 
for the farmer. Even with the move to 
modern equipment, my dad always had a 
special fondness for horses and kept hors-
es around on the farm. Although many of 
my personal experiences with horses were 
positive, I had on a few occasions to get 
injured. I learned the hard way that get-
ting on a young colt was a recipe for get-
ting thrown off and kicked in the head. I 
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also came to learn that an electric fence 
and a pony were not a good match. I 
learned that with horses, there definitely 
was a school of hard knocks. Upon leav-
ing the farm, I thought I was through with 
horses. As I grew older and moved on in 
my turf management career, I once again 
came into contact with horses. Upon 
being named Golf Course Superintendent 
of Oneida Golf and Riding Club in Green 
Bay, I once again came into contact with 
horses. Oneida provided horse boarding 
and riding facilities for the members along 
with a limited amount of non-member 
boarding facilities. Initially, I had very lit-
tle contact with the operation of the horse 
stables. After a succession of bad stable 
managers and mismanagement, I was glo-

riously given the 
added responsibili-
ty of managing the 
stable operations. 
After a few years, 
it was becoming 
apparent to all that 
the stable opera-
tion was a tremen-
dous expense for 
the Club when 
compared to the 
actual number of 
club members 
using and boarding 
horses. The final 
straw that broke 
the horses back 
was the requested 
expenditure of one 
million dollars to 
upgrade the stable 
facilities. This was 
quickly voted 
down along with 
the decision to end 
the stable opera-
tion. The house, 
barn and riding 
arena were soon 
demolished, the 
driving range 
extended, and a 
new club entrance 
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throughout the length of the seven-kilo-
meter track equestrian track. The sand 
slitting operation was added after the 
project was completed, as the track 
designer was concerned about drainage in 
the event of wet weather. Summers can 
be very wet in Hong Kong. During the 
summer of 2006, each month of June, July, 
and August we received in excess of thirty 
inches of rainfall per month. A contractor 
from Australia that specializes in drainage 
was hired to perform the sand slitting 
process, which covered just less than eight 
weeks in duration. So for eight weeks, 
once again the golfing membership faced 
a maze of construction on the golf courses. 
Construction finally was completed by 
early April, just as the normal golf season 
was coming to a close. Although the golf 
courses are open year round, the main 
golf season is from September 15th 
through April 15th. Due to the warm, 
humid, wet conditions of summer, many 
of our European members return to 
Europe to take advantage of the cooler 
weather. The Asian club members that 
live in Asia year round play most of the 

summer golf. 
As part of the preparation for the 2008 

Olympics, an Equestrian Test Event was 
held on August 12th. For this event, forty 
horses and riders from throughout the 
world were brought in to test a portion of 

the Equestrian Track covering 15 jumps 
and 4 kilometers. The purpose of the 
Event was to not only test a portion of the 
track itself, but also test all the logistics 
that go along with holding an Olympic 
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event. Lock-down security, security tents, 
viewing marques, refreshment stands, on 
course security, veterinary facilities, etc. 
were all located and assembled as needed 
or required. Set-up prior to the event cov-
ered three weeks, and ten days were need-
ed to take down all the structures, clean 
up, repair damaged golf course areas and 
return the courses back to playability. The 
event itself was closely monitored by and 
critiqued by members and officials of the 
Olympics staff. Recommendations and 
proposed changes will soon be forthcom-
ing for track changes, maintenance, jump 
locations, logistics, etc. We were even for-
tunate to be able to check the performance 
of the track in wet weather as we received 
two inches of rainfall in the early morning 
hours just prior to the start of the event. 
For the most part, the Test Event was a 
success and the track received positive 
reviews from the participants and the 
Olympic Committee. Now begins the 
process pf instituting any changes or mod-
ifications, and preparing the track and the 
jumps for next year's Olympic events. 

So, from just a child growing up on a 
farm in central Wisconsin to maintaining 

golf courses in Hong Kong, I have been 
and continue to be involved with and in 
contact with horses. I never intended or 
planned to be involved with horses 

throughout my life, but life is full of sur-
prises and at times unexpected events and 
happenings. For me, that has been a part 
of the Adventure in Life. 
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