
Risk Management: 
Alternative to Insurance 
by Richard Baker 
In today's world of consumer advo-
cacy, multi-million dollar lawsuits 
and governmental restrictions, the 
need for adequate insurance cover-
age is clear. Golf course operations 
are particularly vulnerable because 
of the large numbers of non-em-
ployees that use the facilities. Be-
cause of this exposure to risk, and 
the high cost of insuring against all 
losses, the concept of Risk Manage-
ment can be very important to a golf 
facility. 

Risk management may be de-
fined as the identification, analysis 
and evaluation of risk and the selec-
tion of the best method of treating 
it. Very few golf course operators 
take the time to identify all the risks 
facing their operations. Many own-
ers, operators or managers treat risk 
by simply buying an insurance pol-
icy. As a result, many operations 
buy more insurance than they really 
need. They should be aware buying 
insurance is not the only method of 
treating risk. 

The operator needs a systematic 
approach to evaluate and protect his 
property. Each golf course opera-
tion should be evaluated from the 
standpoint of risk and the manage-
ment of these risks. 

Total risk avoidance can be 
economically impractical, just as too 
high a risk retention can be eco-
nomically and psychologically cost-
iy. 

Management of the golf facility 
must concern itself with the preven-
tion and control of loss. They must 
constantly reevaluate the financial 
capability of their facility to assume 
risk. Finally, they must select the 
best media for funding risk. 

The first step in risk manage-
ment is the development of an in-
ventory of all possible losses. 
Management should be familiar 
with all assets, tangible and intangi-
ble, the sources of income, and have 
an awareness of the potential liabil-
ities which can be imposed by law. 

Once an inventory of exposures 
is completed, management must 
analyze with respect to the financial 
risk presented by each exposure. He 
must ask himself the following 
questions: 

1. How frequently will the loss 
occur? 

2. How severe will the loss be? 
3. What are the total loss possi-

bilities from a single occur-
rence? 

For example, an explosion of a 
gasoline container in a maintenance 
area might do more than damage 
the structure. It could affect the 
maintenance of the golf course if 
equipment was destroyed; it could 
damage surrounding structures; it 
could injure or kill employees; or it 
might damage property of others or 
injure or kill third parties. 

Once exposures have been iden-
tified and their financial risks mea-
sured, management can evaluate 
each risk in light of his ability to ab-
sorb it. There will be some risks 
whose loss potentials are too small 
to affect the financial stability of the 
operation. These can be safely ig-
nored. If other certain losses can be 
predicted, they should be budgeted 
for, since other means of funding 
may be more costly. (For example, 
pilferage in the pro shop and bar, or 
loss of small tools in the mainte-
nance area.) 

Finally, there are risks too large, 
or occurring too often, to be ig-
nored or treated as an operating ex-
pense. These are the risks which 
must be dealt with in one of the 
following ways: 

1. Risk Elimination 
2. Risk Reduction 
3. Risk Retention 
4. Risk Transfer 

Elimination. This is the best 
way of handling any risk. If a course 
can completely eliminate a risk, then 
it does not have to worry about in-
suring against it. For example, the 
deep fat fryer in the kitchen is a ma-
jor source of fire in this area. By 
eliminating deep fried foods from 

the menu, it is possible to eliminate 
the risk of fire from this source. 

Reduction. Managers often find 
risk elimination is not possible. 
Their next consideration is reduc-
tion of loss potential. Proper house-
keeping and the use of protective de-
vices (such as sprinkler and extin-
guisher systems, firewall and fire 
doors, etc.) are often used to reduce 
loss. In the area of liability, tech-
niques such as proper supervision, 
frequent inspection, proper training 
and good maintenance of equip-
ment are used. 

Retention. Many courses could 
safely retain more risk than they do, 
but the idea of buying insurance 
policies for all loss exposures is so 
popular many managers do not con-
sider alternatives. As a result, un-
necessary insurance is purchased 
and many premium dollars are wast-
ed in first dollar coverage when de-
ductible coverage or retention of 
risk would be less expensive. Man-
agement must consider the finan-
cial condition of his operation, cash 
flow position, availability of short 
and long term financing, and plans 
for capital improvements in order to 
make recommendations for risk re-
tention. 

Risk Transfer. For risks that re-
main on the inventory, the manager 
has little choice but to transfer them 
to someone else. This does not 
necessarily mean buying insurance. 
The first attempts at risk transfer 
usually involve non-insurance trans-
fer, often in the form of hold-harm-
less agreements. It may be possible 
to force the supplier, customer or 
contractor to assume liability. The 
party assuming the liability may 
actually be in a weaker position than 
the one transferring, but may be 
forced to accept the agreement be-
cause of their relative position. For 
example, the golf car rental agree-
ment that transfers risk from the 
operator to the customer. 

The inventory should be com-
plete, which will result in a clear un-
derstanding of the nature and value 



of the assets. The assets do not have 
to be owned to be included in the in-
ventory. If rented or used facilities 
produce income or contribute to the 
well-being of the course in any way, 
they should be included. Later 
evaluation of risk may determine 
that some of the assets are too small 
to worry about, or reveal a low 
probability of loss. However, all as-
sets should be included in the origi-
nal inventory. It takes patience and 
persistence to develop an asset in-
ventory. It is surprising how many 
operations do not have any record 
of their total assets. 

The next area of concern should 
be Liability Exposure information. 
Liability may be divided into two 
broad areas: liabilities to the gener-
al public; and liabilities to employ-
ees. 

Liability to employees is usually 
defined in the workmen's compen-
sation statutes. There may be addi-
tional considerations outlined in 
union contracts for hospitalization, 
accident and sickness or disability. 

Liability to the public may be 
divided into three different categor-
ies: Premisis; operations: and ve-
hicle. 

1. Premisis liability refers to the 
physical assets of the course: 
land, buildings, machinery, 
fixtures and equipment. 

Some considerations manage-
ment must examine are the con-
struction, physical condition, and 
use to which the assets are put. If as-
sets are rented, they must know 
what obligations have been as-
sumed in the lease or rental agree-
ment. They must be aware of the 
means of ingress and egress to the 
property, and any problems or im-
pediments connected with them. 
They should know if fire or smoke 
detection equipment is available, 
what kinds of alarm or supervisory 
service is connected to the equip-
ment, and what kinds of automatic 
extinguishing equipment exist. This 
kind of information is important be-
cause the owner of the property 
could be liable for bodily injury re-
sulting from negligently failing to in-
stall proper safeguards. 

2. Operations are of obvious im-
portance, because what goes 
on or even away from the golf 
course can create liability ex-
posures. 

3. Vehicle liability is an expo-
sure that must be considered 
by most golf course opera-
tions. 

Vehicular exposure may be fur-
ther divided into two categories: 
owned or leased vehicles and non-
owned vehicles. A full list of all 
owned or leased vehicles is neces-
sary, along with a description of 
their use and garage locations. 
Maintenance programs should be 
audited to determine the regularity 
and quality of inspections and ser-
vice. 

While gathering the informa-
tion on vehicles, it is important not 
to overlook the drivers. Recently a 
young man was hired as a mainte-
nance worker on a Cal i forn ia 
course. The superintendent spent an 
hour discussing equipment checks, 
operations, procedures and general 
safety rules. However, he failed to 
check the man for a valid driver's li-
cense. It turned out that he did not 
have one. He was involved in a traf-
fic accident, but fortunately for the 
golf course owner, was driving his 
own vehicle and was not on com-
pany business. 

Risk Evaluation and Analy-
sis. The next step in protecting the 
property. Once the data on risk ex-
posure is compiled, it must be ana-
lyzed to determine the extent of its fi-
nancial implications. Exposures 
must be evaluated to see which are 
significant and which are of no con-
sequence. This process of evalu-
ation is often a subjective process 
rather than an objective one. Cer-
tain people, by nature, are more 
willing to take risks than others. The 
golf course owner should attempt to 
analyze his own unconscious atti-
tude toward risk. If he is generally a 
high risk taker, he should temper his 
evaluation of company risks. If he 
finds himself to be a low risk taker, 
he could be more bold in his evalua-
tions. The important thing is to be 
aware of these subconscious factors 
which may have a bearing on deci-
sion making, and try to eliminate 
them as much as possible. 

With these factors in mind, the 
manager proceeds with the analysis 
of his risks. This process turns the 
exposure information into an in-
ventory of risks. Financial loss can 
arise from destruction of buildings, 
machinery, equipment, or inven-

tory; from theft or embezzlement; 
from a lawsuit; from injuries to an 
employee; or from any one of a large 
number of other causes. All such 
possibilities should be included in 
the original inventory of exposures 
whether they seem significant or 
not, and whether they are insurable 
or not. 

The objective at this point is to 
completely list everything " tha t 
could happen." The manager is now 
ready to evaluate which risks are 
significant and which can be safely 
ignored. 

Risk evaluation, like exposure 
identification, is a continuing proc-
ess. Risk cannot be evaluated once 
and filed away. Risk must be con-
stantly appraised and reappraised in 
light of changes in the economy and 
the financial position of the opera-
tion. The manager should attempt 
to keep abreast of changing condi-
tions and the changing relativity of 
risk. 

Risk Control. One of the most 
important aspects of risk manage-
ment. It begins after an inventory of 
risks has been identified, analyzed 
and evaluated. The most efficient 
method of treating these risks is to 
eliminate them completely. Ob-
viously this is not always practical. 
Therefore, whatever risks remain 
must be reduced. 

Risk managers for large or-
ganizations often say one of their 
main objectives is to avoid using in-
surance. They want to control risks 
so closely insurance will be needed 
only for a catastrophic situation. 

Two categories of risk account-
ing for almost all non-business risks 
to which a course operation is ex-
posed are property risks and liabil-
ity risks. A list of property risks 
would include: damage to real and 
personal property, (including fire, 
wind, collapse, water and smoke 
damage, and vandalism); loss of 
money or securities (which would 
include robbery, burglary and em-
ployee fidelity); and any business in-
terruption due to any of the preced-
ing. 

Liability risks may be divided 
into losses which affect employees, 
such as workmen's compensation 
and non-occupational disabilities, 
and losses affecting the general pub-
lic. 

For fixed property, risk control 



Risk CONTINUED 

begins with the basic construction of 
the structures. If the buildings are in 
existence, little can be done to alter 
their basic construction. However, 
the fire insurance rate schedule, 
which may be obtained from a local 
rating bureau, may indicate charges 
for certain deficiencies and unsafe 
conditions which could possibly be 
corrected. 

The best method of risk control 
begins in the planning phase. The 
manager should consider risk con-
trols when planning any new con-
struction, additions or alterations. 
For example, a site chosen for a new 
clubhouse or maintenance building 
may be inappropriate because of 
natural risks such as earthquake, 
landslide or flooding possibilities. 

There are several other methods 
of controlling risk: 

1. Safety precautions: explo-
sion proof light fixtures or 
unbreakable glass in high 
vandalism areas. 

2. Fire protection systems: auto-
matic ext inguishers over 
stoves and grease ducts . 
Sprinkler systems in larger 
buildings. 

3. External security in the form 
of fences or night watchmen 
to discourage vandalism and 
burglary. 

4. Good housekeeping pro-
cedures: can prevent fires and 
personal injuries. 

5. Main tenance : prevent ive 
maintenance should be sched-
uled and followed, and re-
pairs should be made promp-
tly. The use of equipment in 
damaged condition exposes 
employees to unnecessary 
risks. Building and other 
structural damages exposes 
employees and the public to 
unnecessary risks. 

Personal property risks such as 
the theft of pro-shop merchandise, 
money, fixtures or food and bever-
age items may be controlled in the 
following ways: 

1. Burglar alarm systems prop-
erly installed, maintained and ser-
viced can greatly reduce the risk of 
burglary. There are numerous types 
of systems available. A competent 

alarm company should survey each 
location and recommend the prop-
er system. 

2. One of the best methods of 
controlling the loss of money due to 
robbery is to control the amount of 
cash in the registers and on the 
premisis. The manager should insist 
that no more than several hundred 
dollars is kept in any one location at 
any one time. As receipts accumu-
late during the day, money should 
be deposited in the manager's safe. 
Nightly deposits to the local bank 
are a necessity, and it may be neces-
sary to make a midday deposit on 
busy weekends. 

3. Good inventory control pro-
cedures are an excellent method of 
controlling losses in the pro shop, 
restaurant and bar. Weekly inven-
tories of major food items and li-
quor, along with daily liquor break-
age counts will help control losses. 
A semi-monthly inventory of sensi-
tive golf shop items will help reduce 
the loss of merchandise. 

4. In many golf course opera-
tions there is a danger of embezzle-
ment. One of the fundamental con-
trols is the separation of duties. Em-
ployees who handle money should 
not be responsible for the records 
which keep track of it. Bank recon-
ciliations should be made by per-
sons other than those who write 
checks or make deposits. If possi-
ble, different people should handle 
merchandise and the records that 
keep track of the merchandise. 

That takes care of the property 
risks. The next area of concern is 
liability risks. As mentioned earlier, 
liability risks are divided into two 
categories: injuries to employees and 
injuries to the public. 

The major work safety stan-
dards are defined in the 1970 Feder-
al Occupational Safety and Health 
Act. Rather than discuss the OSHA 
requirements, suffice it to say all 
jobs on the golf course should be 
examined from the risk point of 
view. 

A final step toward controlling 
risks is that of employee attitude. 
All employees, from pro shop and 
restaurant to golf course mainte-
nance personnel should be schooled 
in proper customer contact behav-
ior, proper safety procedures and 
proper operation of all equipment. 

Now that the risks connected 

with the inventory of potential loss 
exposures has been evaluated and 
attempts have been made to reduce 
risk through the techniques of 
avoidance, elimination and control, 
it becomes necessary to consider 
financing. The first consideration is 
called Risk Retention. Retention 
may have been used during the 
evaluation stage when some risks 
were removed from the original in-
ventory because they were consid-
ered inconsequential. The operator 
must now concern himself with the 
conscious retention or larger known 
risks. 

Many course operators have al-
ways purchased insurance for par-
ticular risk situations and are there-
fore reluctant to think in any other 
terms. Attempts are being made to 
change this traditional type of think-
ing. For one thing, many opera-
tions are practicing risk retention 
through numerous exclusions in ex-
isting policies. Many practice a form 
of "unconscious" risk retention in 
areas where exposures to losses have 
not been carefully studied. For ex-
ample, under a "named peril" in-
surance policy, there may be no cov-
erage for flood, earthquake, col-
lapse or other incidents which could 
cause a loss. Even so-called "all 
risk" property insurance policies 
will usually exclude war, myste-
r ious d isappearance , inventory 
shortage and other perils. 

There are several different rea-
sons for retaining risk. The first and 
foremost is financial. It is a fact it 
costs money to operate the insur-
ance companies. Files must be set 
up, claims adjusted, overhead paid 
and a profit generated. Therefore, it 
is clear that for losses the golf course 
can absorb, they may be able to 
operate the system for themselves 
less expensively than the insurance 
company. For example, all mainte-
nance type losses should be borne by 
the golf course operation. The major 
function of the insurance company 
should be protection from catas-
trophe. It is a fact that for certain 
types of losses it is simply less ex-
pensive to retain them than it is to 
transfer them to a company. 

There are alternatives to buying 
insurance. Purchasing an insurance 
policy should be the last resort when 
dealing with the many risks associ-
ated with operating a golf facility.D 




